June 8, 2010

A budget hearing and regular monthly business meeting of the Board of Education of Port
Jefferson Union Free School District was held on June 8, 2010 at Edna Louise Spear
Elementary School. Present at the 7:00 p.m. call to order by President Stacey Zink were
Vice-President Elisa Scott, Board Members Mark Doyle, and Lauren Hubbard,
Superintendent of Schools, Max Riley, and District Clerk Janice Baisley. Board Member
Marybeth Collins arrived at 7:20 p.m., Board Member Robert Frey arrived at 7:25 p.m., and
Board Member Robert Ramus was absent.

The District Clerk reviewed the following:

Voter Qualifications:
1) a citizen of the United States
2) eighteen years of age or older

3) a resident within the school district for a period of 30 days next preceding the
meeting at which the individual is to vote

Voting Procedures:

- Voting will be by machine on Tuesday, June 15, 2010 from 6:00 AM to 9:00 PM,
in the cafeteria at Earl L. Vandermeulen High School.

- Applications for absentee ballots are available from the District Clerk.

- No electioneering will be permitted within 100 feet of the polling place.

Ballot Information:

Proposition 1: Shall the annual budget of the Port Jefferson School District for the school year
2010-2011 in the sum of $37,354,521; as proposed by the Board of Education with the requisite
portion thereof to be raised by taxation on the taxable property of the District, as required by law,
be adopted?

Interim Assistant Superintendent for Business, Larry Blake, reviewed the revised 2010-2011
proposed budget. A question and answer period followed.

At 7:40 p.m., motion was made by Ms. Collins, seconded by Dr. Doyle and carried 6-0 to
adjourn the budget hearing and commence the regular monthly business meeting.

Motion was made by Dr. Doyle, seconded by Dr. Hubbard and carried 6-0 that the Board
approve the minutes of the following meetings:

Special Meeting held May 10, 2010

Regular Meeting held May 11, 2010

Work Session held May 22, 2010

Special Meeting held May 27, 2010



Ms. Zink announced the open forum.
A . Witrock — inquired about status of laptop program

Ms. Zink presented Student Representative, Lucy Rosner, with a plaque in recognition of service
to the Board of Education.

Student Representative, Lucy Rosner, reported on high school activities

End-of-Year Board Committee Reports were presented as follows:
Communications Committee — Dr. Hubbard

Curriculum Committee — Dr. Doyle

By-Laws Committee — Ms. Scott

Budget Committee — Dr. Frey

Facilities Committee and Finance Committee to be presented next meeting.

Motion was made by Dr. Doyle, seconded by Dr. Hubbard and carried 6-0 that that as
recommended by the Superintendent of Schools, the Board approves the following resolutions
appearing on the June 8, 2010 consent agenda:

Personnel - resolutions numbered 1-7

Finance - resolutions numbered 1-6

Facilities and Operations

Education - resolutions numbered 1-2

oWy

Motion was made by Dr. Doyle, seconded by Dr. Frey and carried 6-0 that the Board approve the
following policies presented for a second reading and adoption

Policy 4220, Educational Initiatives

Policy 2926, Hiring Personnel Other than the Superintendent
Policy 9120.1, Nepotism and Patronage

Policy 9240, Recruiting and Hiring

Policy 2250, Board Committees

M e

Motion was made by Dr. Doyle, seconded by Dr. Frey that the Board designate July 13, 2010, as
the date of the Annual Reorganization and Regular July Business Meeting of the Board of
Education. Discussion ensued regarding board member availability. Motion was made by Dr.
Hubbard, seconded by Ms. Collins and carried 6-0 to table designation of the date for the
reorganization and regular July meeting until the June 22, 2010 meeting.

Ms. Zink announced the second open forum.

A.Lustig — personal attacks
- negotiations

At 8:10 p.m., motion was made by Ms. Collins, seconded by Dr. Doyle and carried 6-0 to
adjourn.




CONSENT AGENDA June 8, 2010

A. Personnel

1.

Request for Leave — Teacher

The Board approves the request from Jennifer Walling for an extension of her
leave of absence for the 2010-2011 school year, in accordance with Article
IX.F.1. of the negotiated agreement with the Port Jefferson Teachers Association.

Request for Leave — Teacher

The Board approves the request from Megan Roth-Ueno for an extension of her
leave of absence for the 2010-2011 school year, in accordance with Article
IX.F.3. of the negotiated agreement with the Port Jefferson Teachers Association.

Recall — Paraprofessional

The Board approves the recall of Lori Russo as a Teaching Assistant, effective
May 4, 2010 in accordance with the negotiated agreement with the Port Jefferson
Paraprofessionals Association.

Reclassification — Paraprofessional

The Board approves the reclassification of Mary Jo Zimmerman from Teacher
Aide to Teaching Assistant, effective April 26, 2010.

Summer Appointments

The Board approves the following appointments to assist in the Technology
Department at the hourly rate of $9.00/hour, 40 hours per week, for the period
June 21, 2010 to on or about September 3, 2010:

Michael Poat

Thomas Serabian

Kieran Koehnlein (substitute)

Rescission of Appointment

The Board rescinds the April 13, 2010 appointment of Ellen Borenstein as
Elementary School Assistant Principal.

Summer Appointments

The Board approves the appointment of the following for the 2010 Summer
Academy and district special education program:
TEACHERS:
7/6/10-8/5/10 Scott Garofola (Summer Academy)
Lori Buynoch (Home Instruction)



TEACHING ASSISTANTS:

7/6/10-8/13/10 Lynne Lalia (Special Education)

7/6/10-8/5/10 Kathy Siani (Summer Academy)
Deborah Wilson (Summer Academy)
Vicki Jobst (Summer Academy)
Ellen Boehm (Summer Academy)
Laura Wickel (Summer Academy)

TEACHER AIDE:
7/6/10-8/5/10 Maureen Colon (Summer Academy)
B. Finance

1. Financial Reports
The Board approves the financial reports.
2. Vote Officials

The Board adopts the following resolution designating the Chairperson, Acting
Clerk, Chief Election Inspector and Inspectors of Election for the June 15, 2010
Budget Vote; and further, that the compensation for said officials be at the rate of
$10.00 per hour.

RESOLVED by the Board of Education of Port Jefferson Union Free School
District, in the County of Suffolk, New York:

Section 1. Pursuant to the provisions of the Education Law, Amold Lustig, a
qualified voter of the Port Jefferson Union Free School District, in the County of
Suffolk, New York (the “District”), Amold Lustig is hereby appointed to act as
the Chairperson of the Budget Vote to be held in the District on June 15, 2010,
and the District Clerk is hereby authorized and directed to give written notice of
the appointment of such qualified voter so appointed by this Board of Education.

Section 2. Pursuant to the provisions of the Education Law, Arnold Lustig, a
qualified voter of the District, is hereby appointed to act as the Acting Clerk at
said Vote/Election, in the absence of the District Clerk.

Section 3. Each of the following qualified voters of the District are hereby
appointed to act as Inspectors of Election, including one such qualified voter
appointed as Chief Election Inspector, at said Vote/Election and shall perform
such duties and take such action as prescribed by the Education Law:

Lesley Chesley Eileen Coen Margaret Smith
Joan Fortgang Deborah Frank Helen Kristich
Samantha Free Stephanie Free Nancy Lustig

Mabel Ackerman Mary Moore Thomas Hummel



Section 4. The District Clerk is hereby authorized and directed to give written
notice of appointment to each of the persons hereinabove appointed to the
respective offices, and to notify this Board of Education forthwith if any of such
persons refuse to accept such appointment or fail to serve, in which case this Board
of Education is to take such further action as may be authorized in such
circumstances pursuant to the Education Law. In the event that this Board of
Education in unable to hold a meeting to appoint a qualified voter of said District to
fill a vacancy caused by the refusal of any person herein designated to accept
his/her appointment or the failure of such person to serve, the District Clerk is
hereby authorized to appoint a qualified voter of this District to fill such vacancy.

Section 5. The Inspectors of Election are hereby directed to announce the
results of the ballot to the Chairperson of the Vote/Election. The Chairperson is
directed to declare such results and the District Clerk is directed to record such
results.

Section 6. This resolution will take place immediately.

. Bid Renewal — Internet Service

The Board reappoints Eastern Suffolk BOCES to represent Port Jefferson
UFSD in all matters related to the high speed internet connection bid renewal,
BOCES Bid 007-21, with Open Access, Inc. of Melville, NY, in the amount
of $1,500 per month for the 2010-2011 school year.

. Library Contract 2010-2011

The Board approves the Library Services Contract between the District and
the Port Jefferson Free Library for the 2010-2011 school year.

. NYSERDA Grant

The Board adopts the following SEQRA resolution in connection with
NYSERDA Phase I grant funded lighting project:

WHEREAS, the Board of Education of the PORT JEFFERSON UFSD is the lead
agency under the State Environmental Quality Review Process for the purpose of
required determinations respecting the proposed Capital Improvement Projects as
follows:

Interior Lighting Replacement @):

Earl L. Vandermeulen HS#58-02-06-02-0-001-013

Edna Louise Spear ES#58-02-06-02-0-002-014
Industrial Arts Building#58-02-06-02-0-004-001

Music Portable Building#58-02-06-02-0-005-001
Elementary School Field House#58-02-06-02-0-015-002
Administration Building#58-02-06-02-1-009-002




WHEREAS, in 1995, amendments were made to the SEQRA Regulation (Part
617) to classify projects, which will be excluded from the requirements for the
preparation of an Environmental Impact Statement (Type II Actions). The
projects mentioned above are now classified as Type II Actions as determined
by 6NYCRR§617.5 and

WHEREAS, these projects fall under the following categories:

A. Routine Maintenance and Repair 6NYCRR§617.5 (c¢)(1): Maintenance or
repair involving no substantial change in an existing facility.

B. Replace or Rehabilitation 6NYCRR§617.5 (c)(2): replacement or rehabilitation
or reconstruction of a structure or facility, in kind, on the same site, unless the work
exceeds a threshold for a Type I action in 6NYCRR§617.4.

C. 6NYCRR§617.5(c)(8); Routine activities of educational institutions, including
expansion of existing facilities by less than 10,000 square feet of gross floor area and
school closings, but not changes in use related to such closings.

THEREFORE, as the lead agency for the SEQRA determination, all the above
referenced projects fall under Categories “A” or “B” above. The procedure for
Type II Actions, with regard to the SEQRA Process for Capital Projects noted
above is “No Additional Required Action under SNYCRR§617.5(a)”.

. Establishment of Reserves

The Board approves the following resolutions establishing reserve funds:

RESOLVED, that the Port Jefferson Union Free School District reestablish a
Reserve Fund know as the “Accrued Liability and Employee Benefits Reserve”
for the payment of amounts due to employees upon termination; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the 2009-2010 funding for this reserve shall
be provided from district funds not to exceed $200,000 for such purpose.

RESOLVED, that the Port Jefferson Union Free School District reestablish a
Reserve Fund know as the ‘“Reserve for Unemployment” for the payment of
unemployment claims; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the 2009-2010 funding for this reserve shall
be provided from district finds not to exceed $50,000 for such purpose.

RESOLVED, that the Port Jefferson Union Free School District reestablish a
Reserve Fund know as the “Workers’ Compensation Reserve” for the payment of
claims arising out of workers’ compensation incidents; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the 2009-2010 funding for this reserve shall
be provided from district funds not to exceed $100,000 for such purpose.



RESOLVED, that the Port Jefferson Union Free School District reestablish the
contingency fund know as the “Suffolk County Tax Act” as a reserve in
anticipation of taxes to be levied; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the 2009-2010 funding for this reserve shall
be provided from district funds not to exceed $400,000 for such purpose.

RESOLVED, that the Port Jefferson Union Free School District reestablish a
Reserve Fund know as the ‘Retirement Contribution Reserve” for the payment of
New York State and Local Retirement System Contributions; and,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the 2009-2010 funding for this reserve shall
be provided from district funds not to exceed $100,000 for such purpose.

C. Facilities & Operations

D. Education

1.

Committees on Special Education

The Board approves the recommendations of the Committees on Special
Education.

Summer Driver Education Program

The Board approves the agreement between Earl L. Vandermeulen High
School and Jim’s Cornerstone Driving School, Inc., for the provision of
driver education for the summer 2010 session; and further, upon fingerprint
clearance, the Board approves the services of Carlo Busso, James V. Peretta,
Sr., Scott T. Peretta, Elke Moeller and Joseph A. Vicich as classroom
instructors for the summer 2010 driver education program.



June 14, 2010

A special meeting of the Board of Education of Port Jefferson School District was held
on June 14, 2010 at Earl L. Vandermeulen High School. Present at the 7:30 p.m. call to
order by President Stacey Zink, wereVice-President Elisa Scott, Board Members
Marybeth Collins, Mark Doyle, Lauren Hubbard, and Robert Ramus, Superintendent of
Schools Max Riley, and District Clerk Janice Baisley. Board Member Robert Frey was
absent.

Recognition was given to the following retirees:
Jack Bonura
Debra Mazza
Laura Martin
William Stevens

Administrative and teacher tenure candidates were presented. Also recognized were
Kristin Britt and Christina Morgan who received tenure earlier in the school year.

Motion was made by Dr. Doyle, seconded by Mrs. Scott and carried 5-0 that as
recommended by the Superintendent of Schools, the Board grant tenure to the following
administrators:

e Roseann Cirnigliaro — MS/HS Principal — effective August 12, 2010
e Debra Ferry — Director of Physical Education, Health & Athletics —
effective July 1, 2010

Motion was made by Mrs. Collins, seconded by Mr. Ramus and carried 5-0 that as
recommended by the Superintendent of Schools, the Board grant tenure to the following
teachers:

Kate Bernius — teacher of Music K-12 — effective September 26, 2010

Adam Bouchard — teacher of Earth Science 7-12 — effective September 1, 2010
Janelle Nocero — teacher of Elementary Education — effective September 1, 2010
Kristyn Rickmers — teacher of English 7-12 — effective September 1, 2010

Jesse Rosen — teacher of Social Studies 7-12 — effective September 1, 2010

Recognition was given to outgoing Board Members Stacey Zink and Marybeth Collins.
Congratulations and best wishes were extended.

At 8:30 p.m., motion was made by Mrs. Collins, seconded by Dr. Doyle and carried
5-0to adjourn. Ms. Zink invited everyone to stay for refreshments.




June 22, 2010

A special meeting of the Board of Education of Port Jefferson School District was held
on June 22, 2010 at Edna Louise Spear Elementary School. Present at the 7:30 p.m. call
to order by President Stacey Zink were Vice-President Elisa Scott, Board Members
Marybeth Collins, Mark Doyle, Robert Frey, and Lauren Hubbard, Superintendent of
Schools Max Riley, and District Clerk Janice Baisley. Board Member Robert Ramus
arrived at 7:40 p.m.

Ms. Zink announced that resolution A.5. has been pulled from the agenda. Motion was
made by Dr. Frey, seconded by Dr. Doyle and carried 6-0 that as recommended by the
Superintendent of Schools, the Board approves the following resolutions appearing on the
June 22, 2010 consent agenda:

A. Personnel - resolutions numbered 1 —4 and 6 - 9
B. Finance - resolutions numbered 1 - 6

C. Facilities and Operations

D. Education - resolution numbered 1

Elementary Principal, Ted Mockrish, gave a report on plans for the grades 4 and 5 math
program. Discussion ensued.

Plant Facilities Administrator, Fred Koelbel, presented a proposed plan for the storage of
musical instruments at the elementary school. Motion was made by Dr. Doyle, seconded
by Dr. Hubbard and carried 7-0 that the Board approve the purchase of lockers for
elementary school musical instrument storage at a cost of $19,932.

Old Business - Committee End-of-Year Reports
Ms. Scott reported on behalf of the Finance Committee. A Facilities Committee Report
was not available. Ms. Zink indicated that the report was needed by the end of the week.

Ms. Zink confirmed that Board Members had received a copy of the Board Self-
Evaluation Report and asked if there were any additional comments.

Motion was made by Ms. Collins, seconded by Mr. Ramus and carried 7-0 that the
Board designate July 6, 2010 as the date of the Annual Reorganization Meeting and
Regular July Business Meeting of the Board of Education.

At 8:45 p.m., motion was made by Ms. Collins, seconded by Dr. Doyle and carried 7-0
that the Board enter Executive Session to discuss a personnel matter.
The District Clerk left the meeting and Ms. Zink acted as Clerk pro tem.




At 9:30 p.m. the Board reentered general session. Motion was made by Dr. Doyle,
seconded by Dr. Hubbard and carried 6-1 (Ms. Collins opposed) that the Board approve a
certain amendment to the employment agreement with the Superintendent of Schools.
Motion was made by Ms. Scott, seconded by Dr. Frey and carried 7-0 to adjourn.

CONSENT AGENDA 6/22/10
A. Personnel
1. Change of Employment Date

The Board approves a change in the date of employment of Mark Flower as Assistant
Superintendent for Business from July 1, 2010 to June 21, 2010.

2. Approval of Payment

The Board approves retroactive payment for Mary Jo Zimmerman for 10 periods per
week from November 2009 through March 2010, at the Teacher Assistant rate of pay.

3. Leave of Absence

The Board approves a child care leave of absence for Rachel Erickson, elementary
teacher, for the 2010-2011 school year, in accordance with Article IX.F.1. of the
negotiated agreement with the Port Jefferson Teachers Association.

4. Memorandum of Agreement

The Board approves a Memorandum of Agreement between the District and the Port
Jefferson Office Staff Association providing the terms and conditions of employment for
these employees for the period July 1, 2010 through June 30, 2013.

5. Memorandum of Agreement
The Board approves a Memorandum of Agreement between the District and the Port

Jefferson Administrators Association providing the terms and conditions of employment
for these employees for the period July 1, 2010 through June 30, 2014.

6. Resignation

The Board accepts the resignation of Meghan Ederle as a teacher of Special Education
effective June 30, 2010.



7. Retirement

The Board accepts the resignation of William Stevens, Maintenance Mechanic I, for the
purpose of retirement, effective July 2, 2010.

8. Employment Benefits - Secretary to the Superintendent

The Board approves a 2.25% increase in salary to Janice Baisley, Secretary to the
Superintendent; and, extends her employment benefits to June 30, 2011.

9. Approval of Employment Agreements

The Board approves the respective Employment Agreements for Mark Flower, Assistant
Superintendent for Business, and for Donna Guiffre, Assistant Superintendent for Pupil
Personnel Services; and authorizes the Board President to sign said documents.

B.Finance
1. Scholarship Acceptance

The Board gratefully accepts $1,000 from the Suffolk County Chapter of the New York
State Association for Superintendents of School Buildings and Grounds for the purpose
of a scholarship fund.

2. Cooperative Bid — Furniture

The Board authorizes the Port Jefferson UFSD to participate in the New York State
Cooperative Bid for Various Types of School Furniture and Equipment, dated March 25,
2010, with Education Data Services for Classroom Seating, Early
Childhood/Kindergarten Furniture, Classroom Tables, Bulletin Boards, Tackboards,
White Marker Boards, Computer Tables, Computer Carts, File Cabinets/Teacher Desks,
Library Furniture, Maps/Globes, A/V Equipment, Carts, Science Furniture, and Cafeteria
Tables.

3. Music Supplies & Sheet Music Bid

The Board awards the music supplies and sheet music bid on a per item basis to the
lowest responsible bidders meeting specifications, as attached, for the 2010-2011 school

year.
4, Musical Instruments Rental Bid

The Board awards the Musical Instruments Rental Bid to the lowest responsible bidder
meeting specifications, namely, Advantage Music, in accordance with the bid
specifications for the 2010-2011 school year.



5. Printed Forms Bid

The Board awards the printed forms bid on a per item basis to the lowest responsible
bidders meeting specifications, as attached, for the 2010-2011 school year.

6. RFP — Accounting Services

The Board approves the appointment of Cullen & Danowski to assist the district with the
year-end closing of the books and the preparation of its financial statements for the 2009-

2010 school year in the amount of $21,400.

C. Facilities & Operations

D. Education

1. Curriculum Maps

The Board approves the following ATLAS Curriculum Maps:

Elementary:
1st Grade Math

2nd Grade Math

3rd Grade Math

4th Grade Math

5th Grade Math
Kindergarten Writing
3rd Grade Writing

4th Grade Writing
Kindergarten Reading
3rd Grade Reading

5th Grade Reading

3rd Grade Social Studies
4th Grade Social Studies
Middle School:

6th Grade Math

7th Grade Math

6th Grade Writing

6th Grade Reading

6th Grade Jr. Great Books
7th Grade English

8th Grade English

8th Grade Humanities

8th Grade Social Studies
Electronic Music, 8

High School:

11th Grade English

AP Literature, 11

AP Language, 12

9th Grade Social Studies
AP World History

11th Grade Social Studies
AP US History

Integrated Algebra
Algebra II/Trigonometry
Italian II

Digital Music, 9



Port Jefferson U.F.S.D

PORT JEFFERSON, NY

PRINTING BID
2010-2011
Quantity SAV-ON Printing SGLI, Inc.
item Description Requesting Printing Spectrum
Curriculum / Special Education
Pre-printed Window Envelopes 4 boxes of 500 $ 100.00 No Bid R
Pre-Printed Regular Envelopes 4 boxes of 500 $ 100.00 No Bid 08 e
Superintendent's Conference Day Folders 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 X 3 Cube "Name TBD" 60 pads of 650 sheets ' No Bid No Bid
5 1/2 X 8 1/2 Pad "From the Desk of TBD" 10 pads of 50 sheets g No Bid $ 50.00
Business Cards 500 No Bid No Bid
District Office
Pre-printed regular Envelopes 6 boxes of 500 $ 138.00 No Bid ESEITE V0B
Memo pads - "From The Desk Of TBD" 5 pads for 2 people 250100 No Bid $ 50.00
Business Cards 500 | No Bid No Bid
Address Labels (district-wide) 1000 28 No Bid No Bid
Memo Post-it pads - "From The Disk Of TBD" S
5 pads for 2 people $ No Bid $ 50.00
J&M. Transportation
>reprinted envelopes 5 boxes of 500 $ 115.00 No Bid
Jreprinted Envelopes White, Bulk Rate 6 Boxes of 500 $ 138.00 No Bid
fiddie School
reprinted Envelopes #10 White, Bulk Rate 4 Boxes of 500 $ 100.00 No Bid
mprinted #10 Regular White Envelopes 10 Boxes of 500 $ 225.00 No Bid 29!
nprinted Brown Kraft (open ended/no clasp) ok
nvelopes (6 x 9) 1 Boxes of 500 S b8i00] No Bid $ 107.25
00k Custody Receipt (4" x 7™) 4,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
tudent Pass Pad (5 172" x 3 100 pads ggm No Bid No Bid
irade 8 Moving -up Programs 300 $ 276.00 No Bid
rade 8 Moving -up Invitations w/ Envelopes 500 195.00 No Bid 07£00;
isciplinary and Cutting Referral 200 o SEP000 No Bid No Bid
ementary School
X 3 Cube "Name TBD" 10 pads of 650 sheets =20 No Bid No Bid
X 3 Cube "Name TBD" 60 pads of 650 sheets 3 No Bid No Bid
1/2 X 8 1/2 Pad "From the Desk of TBD" 60 pads of 50 sheets $ 106.00 No Bid ¢
1/2 X 8 1/2 Pad "From the Desk of TBD" 20 pads of 50 sheets |- $75:72538100; No Bid
. K.Progress Report 150 $ 88.00 No Bid )
ades 1 & 2 Progress Report 300 $ 124.00 No Bid 0:00.
ades 1 & 2 Progress Report 350 $ 136.00 No Bid a0,
. 3 Progress Report 200 $ 100.00 No Bid : ;
. 3 Progress Report 150 $ 88.00 No Bid E : i
.4 Progress Report 200 $ 100.00 No Bid
5 Progress Report 200 $ 100.00 No Bid
5 Progress Report 150 $ 88.00 No Bid & -
5. K-3 Independent Writing 600 : No Bid No Bid
5. K-3 Reading Curriculum 600 8! : G No Bid No Bid
;. K-3 Progress Report Envelopes 550 BTENE No Bid $ 163.25
i. K-3 Progress Report Envelopes 650 TSR, No Bid $ 192.90
.. 4&5 Progress Report Envelopes 350 $ %50 No Bid $ 148.40
ides K & 1 Phys. Ed. Assessments 250 ; No Bid No Bid

Page 1 of 3




Port Jefferson U.F.S.D
PORT JEFFERSON, NY

PRINTING BID
2010-2011
Quantity SAV-ON Printing SGLI, Inc.
Item Description Requesting Printing Spectrum
Grades K & 1 Phys. Ed. Assessments 300 £ No Bid No Bid
Grades 2-5 Phys. Ed. Assessments 550 L W10 No Bid No Bid
Letterhead w/purple ink 500 $ 78.00 No Bid o
Letterhead w/purple ink 1500 $ 124.50 No Bid 7
Pre-printed envelopes 10 boxes of 500 $ 225.00 No Bid g
Pre-printed envelopes 6 Boxes of 500 $ 138.00 No Bid
Pre-printed Bulk Envelopes 10 boxes of 500 $ 225.00 No Bid
Pre-printed Bulk Envelopes 10 boxes of 500 $ 225.00 No Bid
Pre-printed Bulk Envelopes 4 Boxes of 500 $ No Bid
Imprinted Brown Kraft (open ended/no clasp) =
anvelopes (6 x 9) 1 Box of 500 No Bid $ 107.25
Snack Envelopes 200 No Bid $ 85.00
Jegistration Cards 800 No Bid $ 41.60
Jental Cards 800 2 0}(17)] No Bid $ 41.60
/isitor Passes 8 rolls of 1000 00 No Bid No Bid
/isitor Passes Sheet 200 Sheets No Bid No Bid No Bid
.ate Amrival Slip *° 3000 NoBid * No Bid
‘arly Release Slip 3000 No Bid No Bid
student Recognition Award Certificates 2200 No Bid $ 504.75
S Progress Report 50 No Bid No Bid
ichool Tool (Gr. 4) 125 No Bid No Bid
chool Tool (Gr. 4 & 5) 225 0 No Bid No Bid
tudent Agenda (Gr. 4) 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid
tudent Agenda (Gr. 4 & 5) 225 No Bid No Bid No Bid
usinegs Office
nvelopes 10 boxes (500 each) $ 225.00 No Bid iR 54:00
ddress Labels (district-wide) 1000 2040 No Bid No Bid
emo pads - "From The Desk Of " 5 pads for 6 persons $ 131.50 No Bid S D60
nd Stationary 2 boxes (500 each) g o No Bid $ 102.00
indow Envelopes 2 boxes (500 each) $ 56.50 No Bid i
1k Envelopes .4 boxes of 500 $ 100.00 No Bid )
ik Envelopes (window) 4 boxes of 500 $ 100.00 No Bid i
tterhead w/purple ink 500 i No Bid $ 80.60
isiness Cards 500 No Bid No Bid
hool Budget Notice 4500 7 No Bid $ 232.00
;h Sghool
urse Selection Sheet 700 No Bid No Bid
e chart 650 3 No Bid No Bid
mmencement Programs 750 00 No Bid No Bid
nior Awards Program 300 No Bid No Bid
2 Mast 400 ] 2,985.00 No Bid
iduation Invitations 760 No Bid $ 271.70
iduation Announcements 1020 No Bid $ 175.50
dent Passes 300 i No Bid No Bid
1duct Report 3000 No Bid No Bid
stody Report 5000 a3l No Bid No Bid
white envelopes/Bulk/left corner/rt . FTR
1er/HS 10 boxes/1000 $ 430.00 No Bid
White envelopes/w corner Card / HS 20 boxes/1000 $ 825.00 No Bid
white envelopes /w corner card/Guid 5 boxes/1000 $ 225.00 No Bid

- ~

-~




Port Jefferson U.F.S.D
PORT JEFFERSON, NY

PRINTING BID
2010-2011
Quantity SAV-ON Printing SGLI, Inc.
item Description Requesting Printing Spectrum
#10 white envelopes /w comer card/Athletics 4 boxes/1000 $ 180.00 No Bid
6 X 9 Brown Kraft open end/w corner card/ HS 1000 : No.Bid $ 121.75
9 X 12 Brown Kraft open end/w corner card/ o
Guid 1000 03 No Bid $ 139.00
Cumulative Health Record 500 710 No Bid No Bid
Profile 700 $ 413.00 No Bid A
Student Handbook 550 g No Bid No Bid
Business Cards 1000 80 No Bid No Bid
High School Letterhead 3000 B 95500 No Bid No Bid
Official Volleyball Score Sheet - Non Deciding 300 218 O No Bid No Bid
Official Volleyball Score Sheet - Deciding 100 iSRrL X IaBI000) No Bid No Bid
Athletic Code of Conduct Book 600 § | E No Bid $ 580.00
HORIZON NEWSLETTER (Per Issue) - 117 x 15 QTY 4,500 $ 1,305.00 (B8R 5I004700 No Bid
(Sheet of paper is 22 x 15) finished sizeis 11 x 7 %4
 pages, prints 3 color black + 2 pms color i
*aper is printed on 60# opaque
{1 is ' fold and prepared for mail
-ALENDAR 8.5"x 11" QTY 5,000 o 0o]f $ 3,485.00 No Bid
4 pages total (10 + cover)
‘over prints 4/2 bleed — 10 point coated 2 side
1side prints 2/2 60# opaque
tapled, drill hole and prepared for mail /QTY 5,000
Total Bid| $ 24,167.50 | $ 7,564.00 | $ 7,304.00
Total Bid Award| $ 16,744.00 | $ 1,094.00 | $ 4,004.45
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Music Supplles/Sheet Music 2010-2011 Bid Results

PORT JEFFERSON PUBLIC SCHOOLS

MUSIC DEPARTMENT

350 Old Post Road > Port Jefferson > NY 11777

(631) 476-4447 > FAX (631) 476-4408

BRI T {1\ R e E 7 ? : i i
i i Hiscol
1 GLOBAL BEAT GBXGBF No Bid No Bid
Desc: Sonor Global Beat GBXGBF Fiberglass Deep Bass Diatonic Xylophone
1 river of dreams 1.22 No Bid
1 ching a ring chaw 1.37 No Bid
1 Baby, lts cold outside 1.22 No Bid
1 Believe 1.19 No Bid
1 A Christmas Jazz Trio 1.26 No Bid
1 Christmas Pops Trio 2.01 No Bid
1 Christmas A la Fala la 1.19 No Bid
1 Do you hear what | hear 1.22 No Bid
1 Hot Chocolate 1.19 No Bid
1 Nutcracker Jingles 1.33 ‘No Bid
Sleigh Ride 1.29 No Bid
1 you're a mean one Mr. grinch 1.23 No Bid
1 in the bleak midwinter 1.37 No Bld
1 Kuwa na krlsmasn njema 1.37 No Bid
1 still still stlll 1.33 No Bid
1 If you don't know me by now 1.30 No Bid
1 Don't stop believin 1.75 No Bid
1 cinemagic SAB directors score 20.40 No Bid
1 cinemagic SAB students core 2.69 No Bid
1 cole porter SATB § 2.69 No Bid
1 gerswhin portrait § 5.78 No Bid
1 100 carols No Bid
1 brother noah built the ark $ 1.19 No Bid
1 1l be there $ 1.33 No Bid
1 Smells Like Teen Spirit (Mona Lisa Sound) w/bass 65.00 No Bid
1 God Rest Ye Merry Gentleman {Chip Davis/arr. Longfield) 32.75 No Bid
1 Purple Haze (Hendrix/arr. Moore) $ 30.60 No Bid
1 Moby Dick (Mona Lisa Sound) w/ bass 65.00 No Bid
1 Desafinado (Jobim/arr. Ligon) $ 36.40 No Bid
1 Tangerine (Mona Lisa Sound) w/ bass 65.00 No Bid
1 Break On Through {Mona Lisa Sound) 55.00 No Bid
1 LP Afuche Cabasa - Standard 2680 $ 31.00 i
1 Standard Hardwood Claves $ 25.00 No Bid
1 Small Trap Table with Clamp No Bid No Bid
Clarinet Pad Set 17.14 No Bid
1 Bass Clar. Pad set No Bid No Bid
2 Rubber Vacuum Pad No Bid No Bid
1 Piccolo Pad Set No Bld No Bid
5 Fender Squire Electric Guitars 475.00 No Bid
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10 6 Foot Guitar Cable Pro Co $ 47.50 57.50
10 Electric Guitar string Pack $ 37.90 48.40 2 L
1 Guitar storage cabinet no. 42 No Bid No Bid No Bid
250A942.105
2 Suzuki Violin School - Vol 4 $ 11.20 11.98
2 Suzuki Violin School - Vol 5
2 Suzukl Violin School- Vol.6
10 Older Beginner Piano Course- James Bastien 60.00
2 Suzuki Violin school Vol. 7
3 Suzuki Viola school Vol. 6
2 Apres Un Reve( Cello Solo) Gabriel Faure
International Publications
2 Tarantella Op 23 for celio and piano-Squire
International Publications
3 Dunlop Spray Formula 65 Polish $ 12.72
16 Light Rosin Cakes $ 15.84
13 Red Label Violin D Strings ;
11 Red Label Violin E Strings
12 Red Label Viola C Strings
11 Red Label Viola G Strings
1 Soundtree GM Teacher Curriculum Book
4 Soundtree GM Student Curriculum Book
1 Teaching Music in The Keyboard lab (Book)
1 GarageBand 08 Tutorial Video No Bid
Iter#t AVGARAGEBAND
1 Carols of Olde-Brian Jones 40.05 No Bid
1 Do You hear What | hear- G. Shayne and N. Regny 30.60 No Bid
1 December Fanfare- Andrew Dabczynski 28.56 No Bid
1 | Wonder As | Wander-Johry Jacob Niles 34.00 No Bid
arr./Krogstad
1 Let It Snow- John Caponegro 31.50 No Bid
1 Essential Elements Broadway Favorites 160.00 6.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Flute 3 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Oboe b 4.70 0 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Bb Clarinet 4,70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembies Book 1 Eb A. Sax 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Bb T. Sax 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Trumpet 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Horn in F 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Trombone 4.70 4,99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Tuba 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Percussion 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Mallet Percussion 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 1 Conductors Score 29.90 6.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Flute § 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Oboe § 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Bb Clarinet 4.70 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Eb A. Sax 4.70 4.99
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1 Accent on Achlevemnent Ensembles Book 2 Bb T. Sax 5k $ 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Trumpet g 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Horn in E 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Trombone 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Tuba 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Percussion 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembles Book 2 Mallet Percussion 4.99
1 Accent on Achievement Ensembies Baok 2 Conductors Score § 6.99
1 Rico Tenor Saxophone Reeds. 2.5 Strength § 24.00
5 Lesher with Wire Resonator Oboe Reeds. 65.00 | § 43.75
Medium Strength.
5 Al Cass Valve Oit $ 14251 § 14.95
10 Sterisol ] $ 31.0018 3250
1 Concert Cymbal Stand $ 67.00 3 No Bid
1 Grand Staff | No8id No Bid
1 Name a Note Game ) AT $ 31.95 No Bid
15 10" Music Straws ] 40.35 No Bid
1 Ultimate Music Game Book 28.00 No Bid
6 Orchestra Stickers 20.70 No Bid
6 10 Designs No Bid No Bid
6 Symphony Assort $ 17.82 No Bid
6 Guitar $ 485.88 No Bid
1 The 1st Adventure: Treble Clef Book/CD $ 28.00 No Bid
1 Fiash Card Set 1: Treble Clef . $ 8.95 No Bid
1 Treble Clef island Poster No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Magnetic Two-Sided Fit-a-Rhythm Music Board ] 64.00 No Bid
25 Plastic Bookmarks g 61.75 5 No Bid
1 16" Cymbal § 49.00 : $ 45.00
1 Sure Grip Holders, Pair - No Bid ; No Bid
1 Meinl Bongos with Stand 4 $ 185.00 No Bid
1 Bean Bags, Set of 12 $ 27.90 8.0 No Bid
1 Metal Music Teaching Board No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 The Music Substitute Sourcebook Gr. K-3 ol $ 16.97 No Bid
1 Multimedia CD Player/Dual Cassette Recorder No Bid No Bid
2 Universal Tubing No Bid No Bid
100 1-Piece Recorder 3 395.00 | $ 189.00
12. Blank 60-minute audio cassette tapes No Bid No Bid
10 Bilank VHS tapes No Bid No Bid
1 Blank recordable disks CD-R (30-pack) $ 49.00 No Bid
1 Blank recordable disks DVD-R (20-pack) $ 35.00 No Bid
50 Vocal Octavo (10 each of 5 pieces to be selected) No Bid No Bid
25 Kindermusik Glockenspiel No Bid No Bid
Replacement Bars No Bid No Bid
Share the Music - 1997 / 98 Series No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 MiDisaurus Cd-Rom (Single User) Gr. 1-3 No Bid No Bid
1 Big Book - Grade 1 $ 1,723.00 No Bid
1 Music Reading Transparencies - Grade 1 No Bid )F No Bid
1 Music Reading Transparencies - Grade 2 No Bid i No Bid
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Music Reading Transparencies - Grade 3

ufacturer);

Music Reading Transparencies - Grade 4

Music Reading Transparencies - Grade 5

1
1
1

CD Set - Grade 3 (or other to be determined)

15

Drum Knockers

3

Mini Tambourine

|Mini Maracas

25
50
8

|Red Music Toppers

Music instrument Stickers

Assorted 12 PAK Composer Bookmarks

Assorted Neon Composer Pencil

Music Bookmarks

Music Bookmarks

The Composers'Specials Teacher's Guide

Awesome Activities fo Win....

Around the Music Room in 180 Days

Notespeller

Book 1- Theory for Young Musicians

Book 2 - Theory for Young Musicians

The Complete Piano Player Keyboard Guide

-2

€780 1en

20.00

Pitch Exploration Stories

18.95

Music Makes the Scene

28.00 |

Detective Decrescendo and the Hunt. ..

9.25

Show Us the Music

The Ultimate Substitute Teacher's Music Resource

4
8
4
2
1
1
1
1
1
1
2
1
T
1
1
1
1

The Amazing Music Activities Book

ALLOTMENT FOR MARKERS/DR. SCHOLLS PADS

Indigo Mountain

Japanese Lullaby

Las Mariposas Exoticas

Mississippi Cakewalk

Mister Natural

Momentum

A Mozart Mix

Night Shift

Nightrider

Playful Platypus

Rumble in the City

Salty Sailors Song

Scottish Bobber

Shark Attack

Ships of Ireland

Sinfonia Song

Sioux City Two Step

Starfleet

Subterranean Dance

1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
3
1
1
1
1
1

Valley of the Sun

Variations on a Sailing Song

14.00
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No Bid No Bid
No Bid
] 143.75
b 94.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 19.80 No Bid
No Bid
13.97 No Bid
No Bid
] 6.97 No Bid
4.05 No Bid
12.21 No Bid
g 12.21 No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$ 20.97 No Bid
$ 24.47 No Bid
b 29.92 No Bid
] 31.50 No Bid
28.56 No Bid
28.56 No Bid
28.00 No Bid
31.50 No Bid
28.56 No Bid
27.20 No Bid
28.56 No Bid
84.00 No Bid
23.80 No Bid
28.00 No Bid
26.60 No Bid
24.50 No Bid
31.50 No Bid
40.05 No Bid
29.40 No Bid
28.56 No Bid
28.56 No Bid
28.00 No Bid
g 28.00 No Bid
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1 Waltz of the Goblins ] 26.60
1 Fiddle like the Dickens : 30.60
1 Gaelic Castle 28.00
1 American Fiddle Medley ) 30.60
1 FANTASY ON A COVENTRY CAROL 37.40
1 CHRISTMAS MARCH 28.56
1 CELLO SQUADRON 2 28.56
1 DERVISH 27.20
1 AIR AND CAPRICE 28.00
1 CRUSADER 29.92
1 DOS FUEGOS 28.56
1 DRAMATIC ESSAY 27.20
1 FANFARE AND CELEBRATION 30.60
1 GOBLIN DANCE 29.92
1 MISSISSIPPI CAKEWALK 28.56
1 NIGHTRIDER ) 28.56
1 RHYTHM AND BLUES 28.00
1 DESERT SANDS - 28.00
1 ROCKIN' JAMMIN' SWINGIN' 31.50
1 BARTOK FOLK TRILOGY 26.60
1 CONTREDANSE EN RONDEAU g 40.05

Total Bid Amount| $  7,960.47 | § 510111 $ 2,184.79
Total Bid Awarded| $§ 3,614.15 [ § 1,985.54 | § 1,178.11




